Ref: FOI/00124/CMICB
18 November 2022

Your Request:

1) The number of people in your ICB/ICP area who have been diagnosed
with Epidermolysis Bullosa during the past five years.

2) The number of people with Epidermolysis Bullosa referred to one of the
UK’s specialist EB treatment centres in the past five years.

Note: Specialist centres include children’s services at Birmingham
Women's and Children's Hospital, Glasgow Royal Hospital for Children
and GOSH and adult services at Glasgow Royal Infirmary, Guy’s and
Thomas’ Hospital and Solihull Hospital.

3) How many GPs and frontline healthcare professionals have received
training on Epidermolysis Bullosa diagnosis and care within your area.
Please refer to training undertaken where possible.

Our Response:

Please find listed below the information held by each of the former CCG areas
that now make up NHS Cheshire & Merseyside ICB in relation to the
information requested regarding Epidermolysis Bullosa.

Cheshire
1) 35.
2 - 3) Information not held.

Halton
1 - 3) Information not held.

Knowsley
1 - 3) Information not held.

Liverpool
1) 17.
2 - 3) Information not held.

South Sefton/Southport & Formby
1 - 3) Information not held.

St Helens
1) 14.
2 - 3) Information not held.

Warrington



1 - 3) Information not held.
Wirral

1)7.
2 - 3) Information not held.
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